RESOLUTION #15-52

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING CHANGE ORDERS FOR
THE PURCHASE OF ONE K.M.E. CUSTOM LONG FOUR-DOOR
CHASSIS 2000 GPM SIDE MOUNT ENGINE 511

WHEREAS, the City of Woodbury entered into a contract with Kovatch Mobile
Equipment Corp. for the purchase of one K.M.E. Custom Long Four-Door Chassis 2000 GPM
Side Mount Engine 511; and

WHEREAS, during manufacture various modifications were required resulting in
Change Orders 1, 3 and 5 attached; and

WHEREAS, such additions and reductions have been reviewed and approved by the Fire
Chief; and

WHEREAS, the attached itemized additions and reductions result in a net decrease of
$1,030 to the original price of $389,677.00 for a total contract price of $388,647.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and City Council of the City
of Woodbury that the Mayor is hereby authorized to execute the Change Orders No. 1, 3 and 5
and release of payment to Kovatch Mobile Equipment Corp. in the amount of $388,647 is hereby
authorized.

ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Mayor and City Council of the City of Woodbury

held on January 27, 2015.
CIT F DBURY
By: J ’
DAVID TROVATO,
President of Council
ATTEST:

oy Daf o2

Roy A Dufﬁe!di@?ty Clerk




Chief

From: Skip Stinger <skipstinger@comcast.net>

Sent: Friday, January 16, 2015 2:09 PM

To: Randall Gartner

Subject: Invoice - Engine 511 GSO #9538 Woodbury, N.J.
Attachments: 9538-C05a.pdf; GSO 9538 Invoice.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Chief,

tn preparation for delivery, please find attached a copy of Change Order #5, which was generated at the final
inspection of Engine 511; and also the final invoice for Engine 511 which includes CO #5.

for processing of the payment. Once KME receives payment infull they will release the
: e registered and tagged by the City. If payment in full is ready when we deliver the truck [’
can have the Title in hand to exchange for the check:

Thank you for your coaperation
Sty

First Priority Emergency Vehicles
Mobile Phone: {609) 516-4786
Home Office: (856) 845-6232
Fax: (856) 845-3189

KO VATGH

Bhi This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software,
www avash.oom




WFD-File

KoVATCH MOBILE EQUIPMENT CORP.

One Industrial Complex
Nesquehoning, PA 18240

(570) 669-2461 (Phone] - ——
(570) 669-9966 (Fax) @:’CEIVED o :]

R. 06 .. . ) .
wiww kovateh.cam URL By Randall Gartner at 1:06 pm, Jan 17, 201

INVOICE

C

City of Woodbury ‘Date: December 15, 2014
Clty Hall
33 Detaware Street INVOICE #12152D014-03
Woodbury, NJ 08094
Salesperson; Frst Priodty
Emergency Vehicles-Skip Job: GSO 9538 Dalivary Terms Payment Terms: Net
Stinger
5/E: Ryan Slcme
ey Description Unit Price Line Totat
1 KME ~ Custom Purmper 389.677.00
VIN 1KOAFA283FNDS8Y27 / Modet Year: 2005
LESS: Change Ordear #1 (1.807.00
ADD: Changa Order #3 452.00
ADD: Change Order #5 32500
Subtotal 3886470
Advance /\
Paymeni
) Toial ( $388,647.00

/ ~
KMake alf checks payable to KME Fire Apparalus I /“7//5
Thank you for your business! W}L _‘ \/
T
APPROVED neoC

By Randall Gartrier at 1:07 pm, Jan 17, 2015 \N - \J~ \(0/ k J T -

@_ppcovﬂ’( 715



From: Ryan Sizne <rslane@KOVATCH.com>

Sent: Manday, December 15, 2014 852 AW
To: Randall Gartner

Ce: First Pricrity-Skip Stinger

Subject: RE: GSO# 9539

Eus 511
Chief, : {
GSO#I538. has a credit) &;ﬁ“' o8 533 51, f”*’m "”f% LQ *é’?e FD

s t=3] ?un wwwwww

G50#9539 has & chazge to FD of 81, 108,00 includi ing ‘the additional shelving ang strut =
“\\_’ c

Thanks, c"[’ 5’/2'*"

Ryan

From: Randall Gartner [mailtochisfi@wids ] ozl
Sent: Monday, December 15, 2014 §:46 AM

To: Ryan Slane

Ce: First Priority-Skip Stinger

Subject: Re: GSOH 5539

Will are eredit balance cover the cost?

Randall Gartner Chief
Woodbury Fire Dept.
609-352-4528

Sent from my iPhone

On Dec 15, 2014, at 8:18 AM, Ryan Siane <yslans @ KOYVATCH com> wrote:

Chief,
The cost for adding the additional shelf is $485.00 and the cost for adding Uni-strut is $181.00. Please
advise if this additional cost is approved.

Thanks,
Ryan

Ryan Slane

Product Manager
Pumper/Tanker Group
KME Fire Apparatus
<imaged01 jpg>

Cne Industrial Complex
Nesquehoning, PA 18240

(800} 235-3928 x 5531 Toll Free
{570} 669-5581 Ph

{570) 663-5124 Fax

{5?{}) 413-3450 Cefl

¢

Follow P(?JE on Fooehook and Twiller!




511 Final Invoice

Chief

From: Skip Stinger <skipstinger@comcastnet>

Sent: Friday, January 16, 2015 2:09 PM

To: Randall Gartner

Subject: Invoice - Engine 511 GSO #9538 Woodbury, NJ.
Attachments: 9538-CO5a pdf; GSO 9538 Inveice.pdf

Chief,

In preparation for defivery, please find aitached a copy of Change Order #5, which was gensrated at the final
inspection of Engine 511; and also the final invoics for Englne 511 which includes CO #5.

Please forward to the City for processing of the payment. Once KME receives paymeant in full they wil releass the
Title for the truck so that it can be registerad and fagged by the City. If payment in full Is ready when we deliver the truck, |
can have the Title in hand fo exchange for the check.

Thanl you for your cooperation,
Sty

First Prigrity Emergency Vehicles
Mobile Phone: (B00) 516-4788
Home Office: {B56) 845-8232
Fax: (858) 845-3180

= This email has been checked for viruses by Avast antivirus software.
s v avast.com
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| RECEWED R
l By Bendali Gartaer ot 1:68 pm, .'.fg;'x §7, 2015
Department: Sales Engineering Criginal Issue Date: 12/20/2011
P72-3-F1 Revision: 2
Vehicle Specification Change Order Revision Date: 01/15/2013
Customer:] Woodbury Fire Deparment -Engine 511 GSO#:| 9538
Sales Rep:| 1st Priority - Skip Stinger Change #:] &
Sales Engineer:] Ryan Slane Release Date:] 12/15/2014
Unit Final \é\ﬁ!l{c;a’pge No
Status/Location: affect dalivery
date?
Total Charge to
Sales Rep: $0.00
Totat Charge tq $325.00
Customer:
Authorized By: ﬁgﬁ,ﬂ/@g/z@gi{m«
Distribution List
Sales Rep - Sales Engineer - Accounting - Purchasing - Bill of Materials
Dash/Bumper Construction
Plumbing - Final Fab Parts - Body Weld/Assembly - Fina! Production Plants
COSTTO COSTTO
ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION SALES REP | CUSTOMER
i Add One {1} horizontal grab rail on the driver side rear of body
Provide the following purmp panel tags and bezels
One (1) 100-Feet (Color coded to match front bumper)
2 Two (2} 150-Feet (Color coded to match Crosslay #1}
Two {2) 200-Feet {Color coded to match Crosstay #2)
***Tags will need to shipped to the Dealer™™*
3 Add front of bumper guide rods 5325.00
W”' \% v Y

[37115

Farm F-720-003



Inspection and Verification Report

KOVATC

GSG: 9538 Customer Name: Cily of Woodbury, NJ
Inspection Stage: Final Inspection Inspected By: FD, Skip, & Ryan Slane
Inspection Date: Saturday, December 06, 2014 Dealership Mame / Sales Rep:  1st Priority - Skip Stinger
Egn. 511 (RECEWED ~

Nonconformance / Clarification | &y Rondail Gartoier 81 201 g, Doc 13, 231;[

W ]lem L “Gompleted By
# | Resciution . T

. Cauée: 04-3 Prod%;ctien—Asse.fﬁb.ly
Co# 2 " Provide secondary fue! primer switch in the cab
Corréctive Action: ' R o
. 2 . " Cause: 01-5 Sa?as.’i}esignbustomer preferenice
“The suction hase and iadder doors need to be pa%ntéd job colar.
 Corrective Action: ' o ' ' -
3' - ' Cause: 081 Qué!iiy Control-Function

Driver éécie front bu?rzper hose well Wiring fof the Q2B siraﬁ needs {o be proiécted o)
prevent damage when hose is deployed or the wiring to he re-routed.

Corréctive Actinn:

4 . o . Causs: D4-6 Pmdudés&?inai
Rear of the body paidted surfaces will need to be buffed, appmxéma%ely 30" abbve the rear
step.
Corrective Action:
5 . N  Cause; 04-3 Prociuct;anvAssemb}y
Co#s Add one (1) horizontat grab ralt on the driver side rear of hody, above the suction hose '
. _ ccmpartmer:t,
Corrective Action:
. =6 o ' '  Cause: 04-3 Productiawﬂsssembi?

Sﬁpport the hose bed floor in the area of the tank fill tower.
Carrective Action: '
- '7 ' ' ' Cause: 613 SalesiDesign-Customer requested change
CO#4 ” Add a péir of froht bﬁm'per guide rods {fluminated) ' '
Corrective Action: ' .
B3 . Causa: 051 Quality Control-Funclion
' $teering.whe’e% is off center ' ' '

Corrective Action:

in printed form, this Dotument is st Uncontrotied Copy untess stamped Contralisd Cogy in Red, Page 1 of 1




Department: Sales Engineering
P72-3-Fl1
Vehicle Specification Change Order

Original Issue Date: 12/20/2011

Revision: 2

Revision Date: 04/15/2013

Customer:| Woedbury Fire Department -Engine 511 GSO#y 9538
Sales Rep:} st Priority - Skip Stinger Change #{ 3
Sales Engineer:] Ryan Slane Release Date:| 9/23/2014
Unit Will change
. | CabTrim affect delivery | No
Status/lLocation:
date?
Total Charge to]
Sales Rep: $0.00
Total Charge to
Customer: 3452.00
Authorized By: };éﬂmm s
Distribution List
Sales Rep - Sales Enginear - Accounting - Purchasing - Bill of Materials
Chassis Production - Cab Trim
Final Production Plants -Body/Commercial Cab Pain
COSTTO CaOsST 710
ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION SALES REP | CUSTOMER
1 Delete the 240-volt receptacle for credit. -5180.00
5 Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreline $165.00
powered, in the Driver side rear compartment )
3 &dd one {1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreline $169.00
powered, in the Officer side rear '
Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreline
4 powered, in the Officer side compartment over the rear wheel $169.00
well
Change ene {1} of the two power strips mounted to the rear of
5 the engine enclosure, to be powered by the generator in lieu of $125.00
shoreline.
5 Rear Inner axle wheals will be painted black in color.

| ABBDS
| APPROVE |
é By Randall Garingr gt 11:48 am,

Sep 23, 2014 |

\»/-%}/

-

s gn
Cﬁpgi“ov’@ "/9;7/]9

Pagelofl

Form F-720-003




Approved CVhange

| APPROVED RN R
| By Rasndall Gartner a1 11:44 am, Sep 23, 2014 l Order 511 & 512
Chief |
From: Ryan Slane <rslane@KOVATCH.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2034 11:28 AM
To: ‘Randall Gartner’
Cc: <sandersen@woodbury.nj.us>; Jim Miller; First Priority-Skip Stinger
Subject: RE: GSO# 9538 E-511 WFD Follow up 9.17.14
Attachments: 9538-C0O3a.pdf; 9539-CO3a.pdf
Chief,

Artached are the change orders to refiect the below changas.

e (RecewveD o
%

Ryan 1 By Randall Gartner 81 17:44 am, Sep 23, 2014

Erom: Randall Gariner [mailto:chief@wid51.org]

Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2014 6:51 AM

To: Ryan Slane

Cec: <sandersen@woodbury.nj.us>; Jim Miller; First Priority-Skip Stinger
Subject: Re: GS0# 9538 £-511 WFD Follow up 8.17.14

Proceed as noted by Ryan in yellow.

Randall Gartner Chief
Woodbury Fire Dept,
609-352-4528

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 23, 2014, at $:27 AM, Ryan Slane </slane @KOVATCH comm> wrote:

Chief,
Listed below is the pricing as requested, Please advise if vou require any additional pricing and/or
clarifications.

E-511

Delete the 240-voli raceptacte for credit. Creditto FD'$180.60

Add one {1} NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreline powered, in the Driver side raar
cornpartment (L-3). Ghargs to FO'$166.00

Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shorefing powerad, in the Dfficer side rear
compariment (R-3). Chargeio FD 8188.00

Add one {1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household recapizcle, shoreline powered, In the Officer side
compartment ovar the rear whea! well (R-2). Charae I FD$169.00

The cost to convert one of the two power sirips mounted (o the rear of the engine enclosure, o be
powerad by the generator, in E-511°s cab Charge to FD §125.00

E-812

Delate the 240-volt receptacie for credit. Creditto FD $180.00

Add one {1y NEMA 5-15 duplex household receplacle, shoreline powersd, in the Driver side rear
compartment (L-3}. Chargeio FD $188.00

Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household recepiacie, shoreline powered, In the Officer side rear
compariment (R-3). Chargeéto FO$189.00




Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household recepiacle, shorgline powersd, in the Officer side
compariment over the rear wheel well (R-2). Charge o FL $169.00

Thanks,
Rvan

From. Randall Gartner Ef% forchi ﬁ‘ij: wfﬁbi i}“‘%

Sent: Tuesday, September 23, 2014 B:44 AM

To: First Pricrity-Skip Stinger

Cer Ryan Slane; <sandercen@wondhury i us>; Jim Miller
Subject: Re: GS0# 9538 E-511 WFD Foliow up 9.17.14

When can we have the total cost for our other request? Once we have that we wiil be able to let know
what we will be going with. Thank you for the quick responsa

Randall Gartner Chief
Woodbury Fire Dept.
609-352-4528

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 22, 2014, at 5:02 PM, Skip Stinger <skipstinzer@comcast.net> wrota:

Chigf,

Yeours for & better and safer fire servies,
Skip

First Priornty Emergency Venicles
Moblle Phone: (808) 5164786
Home Office: (858) 845-6232
Fax: (356} B45-3180

The contents of this E-mai and its attachments are intendad solely for the addressas(s).
in addition, the information contained in this E-mail may be confidential and/or lagally
arivileged, I vou are not the named addresses, or if this message has been addressed 1o
you in error, you are directed not to read, disclose, reproduce, distribute, disseminate or
stherwise use this fransmission. You are also hereby nofified that any unauthorized
raview, use, disciosure, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this communication, or
any of its conients, is strictly prohibited. If you have received this transmission in error,
please alert the sender by reply E-mall and destroy all coples of this message. Thank
YL

From: Handall Gs
Sent: Monday, Septamber 22,2014 1:12 PM
To: Skio Stnosr
Cer Hvan ; mailtosandersen@woodhury.niug ; Jim Miller

Subject: Re: GSO# 9538 E-511 WFD Follow up 9.17.14

You have it correctly noted and yes we know that it will not run off the generator when
on tocation.

1 also got you voicemail suggesting a power strip for a radio back would that on both the
shoreline and off the generatar if so what would the cost be for only 511.
2



Randall Gartner Chief
Woodbury Fire Dept.
609-352-4528

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 22, 2014, at 12:44 PM, Skip Stinger <skipstinzer@comeasi net> wrote:

Chiaf,
It appaars that you want (o do the foliowing:

E-811

Delete the 240-voli receptacle for cradit.

Add one (1) NEMA 5-18 duplex household receptacie, shoraline
powered, in the Driver side rear compartmant {L-3).

Add one (1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreline
powered, In the Cficer side rear compartment {R-3).

Add one {1) NEMA 5-15 duplex household receptzcls, shoreline
powared, in the Officer side compariment over the rear wheelwell (R-2}

E.512

Delete the 240-wvol recepiacie for credil.

Add one {1} RERMA 5-15 duplex household receptacle, shoreling
powered, in the Driver side rear compeartment (L-3}.

Add one {1) NEMA 8-15 duplex household recaptacts, shoreling
powerad, in the Officer side rear compartment (R-3).

Add ona {1) NEMA 5-15 duplex housshold receplacle, shoreling
powered, in the Offcer side compartment over the reer whaebwell (R-2).

From Skin
Hote — that none of the recoptacies will be hot when the truck
is on the scene of an incident. Is that comrect?

On E-511 there are two (2] 3 long 120-volf power strips
reounted in the cab, on the vertical riser at the rear of the engine
enclosure. You may want fo consider having one of these power
stripe powered by the generator so that there Is power avallable o
charge radio chargers.

Let me know when vou want o go fo the factory and | will make
it happen. I ar availabla all next week with limfted availabifity the
weoek of Qcfober Gth.

Yours for a batler and safer firs sarvics,

First Priority Emergency Vehicles
Wichile Phone: (B08) 516-4748
Home Oiffice; (B56) 845-8232
Fax, {858) 545.3188

The contents of this E-mail and iis attechments are intended solaly for
the addressee(s). In addifion, the information containad in this E-mall
may be confidential and/or legally privileged. If you are not the named
addresses, or if this message has been addressad (o you in error, you
are direcied not {0 reed, discloss, reproduce, distribute, disseminates or
otherwise use this ransmission. You are aleo hereby notifiad that any

3



unauthorizad review, use, disclosure, dissemination, distribution, or
copying of this communication, or any of s contants, is strichy
nrohibited, f vou have recelved this ransmission in error, please alert
the sender by reply E-mall and destroy all coples of this message. Thank
YoUL

Fromy: Chisf

Sent: Monday, September 22, 2014 10:51 AM

To: ‘Ryan Sleng'

Ce: 'Firgh Prigriby-Skin Stinper » sandersen@wondbery.nius ; Jim Milled

Subject: RE: GSO# 9538 E-511 WFD Follow up 8.17.14

Ryan

tspole to Skip last Thursday and | was awaiting a reply from him In
regards to suggestions Tor an economical way to have the power we
now foreses Tor both the engines, After further discussion with other
departments we think we have the solution that should be the most
sconomical to us please review and let me know your thoughts and the
cost for the below.

Request #5 Convert/eliminate the existing 240-volt NEMA LE-30, 30
amp receptacie fin the current spect iocated in the rear compartment
on both GSOHE 0538 (514} and GSOH 9535 (312) wirlng 1o be 25 oliows,
Each apparatus G508 8538 [$11) and GR0H 8538 (512} to have 1- 120
volt NEMA 5-15 {duplex household receptacle powersd whan the
shoreline is engaged in the station} located in the rear driver side
compartment. Also each spparatus to have Z-additional 120 volt NEMA
5-15 {duslex household receptacie powered when the shoreiine is
engaged in the station) locations for the two additional receptacias will
be the same in both apparatus G50F 8538 {511} and GS0O¥ 85393 (512},
1- 120 volt NEMA 515 {duplex household receptacie on the rear officer
side compariment and (1) on the officer side compartment over the
whae! well.

Piezse confirm the cost for the above reguest any question please give a

calh

We sre plso going to plan a visit in the next week or 5o that we can
provide aur City Councll with a report and status of the progress for
both apparatus who do | schedule this visit with?

Chief

Randall £ Gartner
Woadbury Fire Depariment
855-845-0068 Sta.
£05-352-4528 Cali

wgw MEDEST oy,



From: Ryan Siane [mailto rmiene@ROVATCH.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2014 4:12 PM

To: 'Chief’

Ce: First Priority-Skip Stinger; ssngersen@woodbury.nius; Jim Miller
Subject: RE: GSO# 9538 E-511 WFD Follow up 5.17.14

Chief Gartner,
Please review the comments lsted below Inred. Tl be in the office all
day on Thursday please feel free to give me a call bo discuss,

Thanks,

Ryan

From: Chief [maitochisf@wlds Lorg]

Sent: Wednesday, Sentember 17, 2014 12:30 PM

To: Ryan Slane

Cc: First Priority-Skip Stinger; sandersen@woodbury.nius; Jim Miller
Subject: RE: GSO# 9538 E-511 WFD Follow up 8.17.14

fyan

This is to follow up on our request of possibly meking 8 change to the
electrical inside of the compartment for our many new battery operated
eguipmeant.

The current specs has power In the compartment on the driver’s side
rear compartment | think § recall 2 dedicated 30 AMP receptacle in both
apparatus on order,

1. Requestfor option #1 credit to eliminate the power in the rear
drivars side compartment per the current spacs in both
apparatus.

Delate one (1) 240-volt NEMA LE-30, 30 amp receptacle in the
driver side rear body compartment  Credit to FD per G504 -
SLE0.00

2. Reguest for option 42 for install & receptacie in the rear
cormnpartment in the same location but with 110 service that is
hot when the truck is plugged in and also runs off the generator,
s addivion duples three prong (house) receptacies’ in the
officer side rear compartment and over the wheel well
compariment on the officer side also power when the truckis
plunged in and powder when off the generator.

Far the receptacies to be powered by shoreline

and/or generator will require a transfer switch to be
provided, With the use of the transfer switch, the generator
would st noad 1o be manuaily engaged to provide powsr to
the transfor switch, The max josd for the wransfer switch is 20
armps,

Addition of the transfer switch Charge to FD per GSO# 5780.00
5



Add one {1} 120 volt BEMA 5-15 [duplex household receptacle)
i % rear compartment Charge per GSO# $1569.00

Add one {1} 120 volt NEMA 515 {dupiex household receptacle)
in ©35 rear compartment Chavgs per G508 5165.00

Adid one {1) 120 volt NEMA 5-15 {duplex household receptadie)
i O35 over the whee! compartiment Charge per G504# 3165.00

3. Requested for option #3 to include option #1 and to remove all
recaptacles’ from the extarior of the apparatus and Install 1
duplex three prong three [house] receptacie in 2ach
cornpartment on both apparatus,

Balete one {1} 240-volt NEMA LB-30, 30 amp receptacie Inthe
drivar side rear body, Cradit to FD per G508 - S180.00
Receptacls cutouts are already included In the front bumper
yout rolease (See attached layout)
Dielete two {2} 120.-volt MEMA 15.20, 20 amp singls twist lock
recapiacios vear of body, Crodi 1o PO per 8508 32400
Add one (11130 volt NEMA 5.15 {duplex housshold recopinde]
i FEE apeh compartment {169.00 per compartment}
- G8O# 9538 (511} includes seven (7] body

compartments $1,183.00

-GS0 9539 {313} includes six {5} body compartments
£1,014.00

4. Reguest for option #4 Suggestion from KME for afl of the new
equipment coming cut with most tools are now working off
hattery's.
sint sxactly sure what information | nead to provide for this..
Some Department hand tools are changing from 120volt to a
hattery operated tools {(such as raciprocating saws] but other
departments prefer the low-cost of ownership of 120-volt
tools comparad to replacement of batteries over the life of the
tool,

&s for hydraulic rescus tool power unlis this remains
snchanped gasfelectric units, Hurst s making 2 strong push
with E-Hydraulic tools in the market

Blease call ma to discuss aption or suggestion that would be cost
effective for use.

Alse can we have an update for kely delivery dates for the o
apparatus piease? {'m walting for an update production s ;Qﬁi}{iﬁg&

Chief

Rondall £ Gartner
Wandbury Fire Depariment
AnE.545-0066 Sta.
500-352.4528 (el

wiw WEDSLors,



From: Ryan Slane [mailtorslene BROVATCH cornl
Sent: Fraday, Auguist 22 2014 11:48 AM

To: ‘chisf@widSi on
Cc: First Priority-Skip Stinger; 'sancersen@wondburv.nius'
Subiject: FW: GS0# 9538 E-511

Chisf,
Just to recap this moming’s phone conversation:

Enging 511 (G504 95838
» Stokes basket storage module will ba re-located above the water
tank in Heu of driver side cofin
s Resr step compartmant door opaning helght will be reduced
from 47-5/8% 1 437
e Rear of body plumbing lavouts still need to be determined (KME
to provide leyouts when available)

Enging 512 {ﬁ;‘%{%“f* 2538}
e Besr step will be changad to 87 deep in the recessed area and

wiil include "»1“ full width extension of the body {(Total step depih
i the recessed area 127 Deep)

Thanks,

Ryan

From: Hondall Gorfner
Sent: Thursday, August 21, 2014 9733 AM
To: Skio Stinoer ; Shawn Audersen ;) Iy Mill

Subject: Re: GS0# 953B E-511

| need Ryan to call me ASAP. | left him a message to explain all of the
changes KME is requesting which seem to be causing a snowball effect
of other changes. Yet we are being asked to approve changes with out
clear explanation showing the actual changes or why. | feel that we
could be approving items that are causing other issues and delaying our
trucks by KME. 1t should not be this hard.

Randall Gartner Chief
Woaodbury Fire Dept.
609-352-4528

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 20, 2014, at 9:29 PM, "Skip Stinger” <skipstinesr@oomeastnal>
wrote:

Chiaf,
Please see Byan's E-mail below, He neads your
approval on the changs in height of the rear step
7



compartment dus o the nsertion of the Siokes Basket
compartmant below the hose bed; and the intermediate
sten between the Siokes compariment and lower rear
compariment. Pieass approve this change so that the
body can be released o producton.

Also, find sttached 2 picture of E-511's cab that |
took on Monday.

P am on the rosd heading for South Caroling (o find
my Son housing.

Thank you for your cooperation,

Firat Priority Emergancy Vehicles
Mobile Phone: (608) 516-4798
Home Ofiice; (856 845.8232
Fax (B56) 645-3188

Sent: Monday, August 18, 2014 1:52 PM
To: First Priority-Skip Stinoer
Subiect: GSO# 9538

Skip,

Waorking with body engineering to release the final body
design. Below is a screen shot of the rear of the
apparatus with stokes basket located above the water
tank. The two (2} rear of body discharges will terminate
in the void space hetween the driver side of body and
the stokes module {Exact iocation to be finalized during
plumbing).

To package the intermediate rear step between the
stokes storage and rear step compartment, the height
of the rear step compartment will nead to be decreased
from 51" to 48" {Door opening 47-5/8" to 437}

Thanks,

Ryan



<image004.png>

Ryan Slane

Senior Sales Engineer
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Department: Sales Engineering Original tssue Date; 1272012011
p72-3-F1 Revision: 2

Vehidle Specification Change Order Revision Date: 01/15/2013

Customer] Woodbury Fire Depariment -Engine 511 GS0O #| 9538

Sales Rep:| 1st Priority - Skip Stinger Change #:| 1
Sales Engineer:| Ryan Slane Release Date:} 5/20/2014

. Wil change
Unit Not in production affect deliv No
Status/iocation: ne ect celvery
date?

Total Charge to

Sales Rep: 50.00
Total Charge to —

Gustomer,| ~>1:807.00

i

Authorized By:| Hesan, (s
tJ

Distribution List
Sales Rep - Sales Engineer - Accounting - Purchasing - Bill of Materials
Cab Engingering - Dash/Bumper Construction - Cab Trim - Final Production Plants
Cab Paint - Cab or Aerial Weld

ITEM NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION

COSTTO COSTTO
SALES REP | CUSTOMER

Cab interior upholstered panels and rear interior wall will be
changed to dark gray viny!

Cah dash and doghouse will be provided with a fuli width and
P reduced length engine enclosure. The cab engine enclosure will
be provided with ABS interior painted with Dark Gray Line-X.

3 Pre-con Changes -$1,807.00

{ oy }
[ APPROVED ]
| By B, Gartner at 12:49 pm, May 27, 2014
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AS per April 14, 2014 KME Document

Eng. 512 GSO# 9538 Credit Extra
Mounting Pane! on front of engine enclosure ltem # 7 Added cost ) 250.00
Pump panel drain valves o innovative lift up style drains. ltern # 20 added

cost S 105.00
Bed Cover Heavy duty blue vinyl cover tem # 23 Upgrade added cost 5 588.00
Exhaust termination to horizontal exhaust below officer side of body. ltem #

45 Credit $ 1,153.00

$1,1353.00 $  943.00

Delta 3 210.00

Eng. 511 GSOH 9538 Credit Extra
Mounting Panel on front of engine enclosure ltem # 7 S 250.00
Pump panel drain valves to innovative lift up style drains. ltem # 22 5 105.00
Bed Cover Heavy duty blue vinyl cover item # 27 5 588.00
Delete (2) Vertical Pull out tool boards ltem#f 29 S 2,228.00

Add (1) floor mounted rollout try in the driver side over the wheel body

compartment. ifem # 30 S £31.00
Exhaust termination to horizontal exhaust below officer side of body. ltem #

a5 Credit $ 1,153.00

$3,381.00 & 1,574.00

Delta $ 1,807.00

JSurplus of both Eng.’s $2,017.00 |

Approved by Chief R. Gartner on 4/19/14 Signe nad emali returned to 5kip
Stinger and Hyan Slane. o

| APPROVED R

By R, Gartner at 6:59 pm, Apr 19, 2014 !

Print Date: 4/19/2014 Change Orders



